Saturday, September 28, 2013

UQHA FALL MIXED HORSE SALE

Salt Lake County Equestrian Center
South Jordan, Utah

HIP HORSE SEX YOB SIRE DAM CONSIGNOR BUYER PRICE RNA PRICE
1 |Name Pending Bridlewood C 2012 |Bridlewood A Hot Dash Gary Laramie RNA $1,800.00
2 [Itsgoodtobefamous G | 2012 |Famous Lane Azi Chick Watterson Bros Family  |Sherri Erickson $2,900.00
Par.

3 |SP Saint Patty F 2012 |Saint Shackleton Private Hawkeye Spencer Peterson Terry Wanner $1,400.00

4 |NineTo Midnight M 2002 |Marquetry Explosive Missile Chrisy Kump ouT

5 |Tacky Guy C | 2012 |Tac It Like a Man Strawfly Dee Dee Gary Carmichael Gary Laramie $5,000.00

6 |llovetotellthestory C 2012 [Mr Piloto Dandjs Toast Pedro Mena RNA $2,600.00
7 |MCB MS Moonlark M 1998 [Moon Lark Pies Delight Gary Laramie Sunset Star Farm $5,200.00

8 |Laynees Dashin Star F 2012 |Cartella Star Jess Dashing Darling Jay Giles Jesus Medina $2,700.00

9 [Name Pending Fit To Fly F 2012 |Fit To Fly Living Livda Loca Gary Laramie Fidel Castruita $1,600.00

10 |RGR Lovinthiseffort C 2012 |Lovin This Corona  [Down Effort Ross & David Hinkins RNA $2,300.00
11 |Five Bar Lily M | 2010 [Brookstone Bay Five Bar Fly The Five Barkers San G Regorio Racing $5,000.00

Stable

12 |Authentic Kate F 2012 |Coronas Fast Dash |Special And Genuine Jeannie Hullinger JI Anderson $6,000.00

13 |RGR Ryonna F 2012 |Ralph Ryon Hugo Omni Ross & David Hinkins ouT

14 |Name Pending Fit To Fly F 2012 |Fit To Fly Bankers Moon Gary Laramie Fidel CASTRUITA $1,600.00
15 |RGR Nashville Chick F 2012 |Nashville Rising Rgr Hugo Heart Ross & David Hinkins RNA $1,900.00
16 |Hot Sign Harley M 2002 |Vital Sign Miss Hot Society Pedro Mena ouT

17 |Hawk Chaser C | 2012 |Hawkinson Whistle Chaser Gary Carmichael Base Ward $2,000.00

18 |Living Livda Loca M 1999 |Pritzi Dah Making Merri Gary Laramie RNA $2.400.00
19 [JV Move The Glass C | 2012 |Maknmoves Grendella JV Quarter Horses Brandon Stokes $1,800.00

20 [WB Applomyeye F 2012 |Famous Lane The Red Rock Rainbow  [Watterson Bros Family ~ [Omar HeRNAndez $4,200.00

Par.

21 |A Hot Dash M 1996 [Society Road Miss Hot Currant Gary Laramie RNA $1,200.00
22 |Name Pending Bridlewood C | 2012 |Bridlewood Bj Running Proud Gary Laramie Garth Stokes $1,800.00

23 |Jess JC JoJo F 2012 [Dashing Jess Perry [Jc Jo Jo Pedro Mena Thompson Racing $2,000.00

24 |Kitellas Gal F 2012 |Winners Version Kitella Chad Richard RNA $5,200.00
25 |Fourty Seven Jones M 2006 |Takoda Miss Easy Five Paula Price NO BID

26 [Mi Secret Perry M | 2011 [Dashing Jess Perry [Graceful Secret Don Pedro Paul Solmonsen $1,400.00

27 |RGR Jess Noble C | 2012 |Jess Cartel Rgr Noblesse Chick Ross & David Hinkins Margarita Meza $2,500.00

28 |RedNAround M | 2002 |Red Sadie Go Round Pedro Mena NO BID

29 |Brimm N Vigor C 2012 |Brimmerton Mongoosecharminghawk |Pedro Mena Mike Scudder $2,000.00

30 |Bankers Moon M 1994 |Moon Lark First To The Bank Gary Laramie RNA $600.00
31 |Five Bar Kate M 2011 |Brookstone Bay Five Bar Fly The Five Barkers Garth Stokes $2,600.00

32 |CR Proud Prince C | 2012 |Winners Version Proud Caption Chad Richard Layne Sprouse $5,000.00

33 |Name Pending Fit To Fly F 2012 |Fit To Fly Mighty Bedunos Pass Gary Laramie Jesus Medina $1,100.00

34 [Magritte M 1997 |Strike Gold Janes Sister Susan Grusendorf Kaydee Draper $500.00
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35 |Easy Whoopie F 2012 |Winners Version Whoopie Dat Black Cody Allred RNA $8,500.00
36 |BuckNDirk G 2011 |Buccaneer Beach Lucrezia Don Pedro Fidel Castruita $1,500.00

37 |Dash Cody Dash C 2012 |Tac It Like a Man Dashingthrutheshow Gary Carmichael Jeff Smith $4.500.00

38 [Sentinel Six C | 2012 |Sixes Royal Brooks And Diamonds | The Running ALLC Tom Spay $3,600.00

39 [On Line Magic M 1997 |Magic Dozen Watch That Line Ashtyn Price NO BID

40 |Twaynas Angel M 1996 |Twaynas Dash Angel Hair Gary Laramie Ernesto Bugarin $600.00

41 |Rolyat C 2012 |Tr Dasher Corona On A Jet Pedro Mena RNA $2.200.00
42 |Name Pending Bridlewood C 2012 |Bridlewood First Flyte Plan Gary Laramie Jesus Medina $1,900.00

43 |Flash N The Girls C 2012 |lvory James Flash N Meter The Running ALLC Uriel Dominguez $6,200.00

44 |RGR Shesa Runner F 2012 |Luckyme Lonely You |Digital Runner Ross & David Hinkins RNA $2,600.00
45 [Name Pending Fit To Fly C 2012 |Fit To Fly Gl Indian Territory Gary Laramie RNA $1,200.00
46 |Pick Up The Pieces M | 2003 |Strawflyin Buds Sheeza Zevi Lady Chrisy Kump Wayne Stark $1,300.00

47 |Diamonds Tiny Effort M 2004 |Proudest Effort Twaynas Diamond Bob Alan Pence Pedro Mena $5,000.00

48 |RGR Ripple N Rise F 2012 |Nashville Rising Dashing Ripple Ross & David Hinkins RNA $1,900.00
49 |0ne Smooth Movin C 2012 |Maknmoves Miss Kissen Te Eric Peterson RNA $3,000.00
50 {Untamed Feature M 2006 |[Feature Mr Jess Untamed Dame Gary Carmichael Jv Quarter Horses $1,500.00

51 [Shady Wicked F 2012 |Terribly Wicked Sonnys Golden Sade Lizbeth Lowe RNA $2.500.00
52 |Sonitas C | 2012 |Sonitas Mr Twister | Two Town Tac Pedro Mena Wayne Stack $1,300.00

53 |Pritzi Malone G 2002 |Pritzi Dah Melissa Malone Paula Price ouT

54 |Gypsy Airs M 1997 |Chicks Beduino Dashing Serenade Gary Carmichael Gary Laramie $4,200.00

55 |Name Pending Bridlewood F 2012 |Bridlewood Make My Delight Gary Laramie ouT

56 |Sprix F 2012 [Swingin Jess Luv You Always The Running ALLC Sog Horses And Cattle $4,900.00

57 |Wyatt Speedster C | 2012 |Onthewingsofglory  |Seduce Gary Carmichael ouT

58 |Version Blue F 2012 |Winners Version Bolexie Blue Chad Richard Thompson Racing $6,500.00

59 |[Stupid Cat M | 2001 [Tactical Cat Annual Report Pedro Mena Ernesto Bugarin $500.00

60 |Name Pending Fit To Fly C 2012 |Fit To Fly High On Signature Gary Laramie ouT

61 [Regards to Apollo M 2000 [Apollo Regards To Cute Bar Ashtyn Price NO BID




